
Bad Co Nation
Band Bios

Lead Guitar / Background Vocals: Hailing from Southern California, 
Charlie Norrie is a veteran of the Los Angeles club scene and is Bad 
Co Nation’s band leader. Focusing on classic rock, hard rock, and 
Metal genres, Charlie’s influences include Jimi Hendrix, Led Zeppelin, 
Stevie Ray Vaughn, and — of course — Bad Company.

Lead Vocals / Percussion: Mike Vaughn was trained by acclaimed 
vocal coach, Don Lawrence while living in his hometown of Brooklyn, 
NY. In addition to Paul Rodgers, Mike’s influences include Paul 
Stanley, Robert Plant, Sebastian Bach, and Ray Gillan. Additionally, 
Mike’s lead vocals and songwriting are featured on three album 
releases from the band Dayride Ritual.

Drums / Percussion: Mitch Sitrin’s influences include Neil Peart, 
John Bonham, and Mike Portnoy. While living in New York City — his 
home town — Mitch had a wonderful experience meeting the 
legendary Buddy Rich, which inspired him to pursue his musical 
career as a professional drummer. Prior to moving to Las Vegas, Mitch 
played throughout New York City at CBGB’s, China Club, Rutgers 
University, and many more.

Fretless Bass / Background Vocals: A former member of both the 
New Mexico Symphony Orchestra and Epic Record’s Redbone, Eddie 
Two Moons has built up a massive resume of performance dates 
since arriving in Las Vegas. Eddie’s credits include working with Dony 
Wynn (Robert Palmer), and Jake E. Lee (Ozzy).

Keyboards / Guitar / Percussion / Background Vocals: From the 
northwest suburbs of Chicago, Robert Anthony is a respected multi 
instrumentalist, musical director, and published author of several 
music books. Robert’s credits include Gene Simmons, The Howard 
Stern Show, and A&E Television, among many more.


